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Appendix to Resolutions of the Annual General Meeting of Shareholders 10 May 2023 
 

Resolution 5.   To re-elect Christen Sveaas as a Director of the Company for a 2-year term.  
 

Mr. Sveaas is Executive Chairman and owner of Kistefos AS, a leading Norwegian 
investment company with a large and diversified investment portfolio. He has held 
several board positions including Treschow-Fritzøe AS, Stolt-Nielsen SA, Orkla 
ASA, SkipsKredittforeningen AS, Vestenfjelske Bykreditt AS, Tschudi & Eitzen 
Shipping AS, Scorpion Drilling Ltd., Southwestern Offshore Corp. and he has served 
as senior advisor to EQT, Sweden. Mr. Sveaas is the Founder of the Kistefos 
Museum, and a named benefactor of the Metropolitan Museum of Art as well as a 
founding member of its International Council, and member of the museum’s 
European Visiting Committee.  Mr. Sveaas holds his Lic. Oec. HSG degree from the 
University of St. Gallen, Switzerland. Mr. Sveaas is a Norwegian citizen. 
Pusurant to Article 81 of the Company’s Articles of Association Mr. Sveaas was 
elected by the Board of Directors of the Company on 20 May 2022. 
 
 
 

Resolution 6. To re-elect Celina Midelfart as a Director of the Company for a 1-year term.  
 

Ms. Midelfart is a private investor, owner and executive chairman of Midelfart 
Capital AS. In her early career she was the third generation CEO of the family 
business Midelfart AS. She was previously a partner at Magnipartners Ltd, working 
actively in the offshore drilling and LNG space. She has since 2015 held larger 
shareholding positions in various listed offshore oil, service and supply companies. 
She is currently a board member and 10% owner of the Swedish Consumer Finance 
Bank, Avida AB, and a member of the Board of Trustees at Oslo International 
School. She previously served on the board of the world largest fish farming 
company, Mowi AS, and the Swedish health and beauty care company, Midsona 
AB. She holds a degree in economics and finance from London School of 
Economics, and Stern School of Business NY. Ms Midelfart is a Norwegian citizen. 
Pusurant to Article 81 of the Company’s Articles of Association Ms. Midelfart was 
elected by the Board of Directors of the Company on 20 May 2022. 

 
 


